Awarded 2-12-09

BOARD OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID TABULATION

SEALED BID 58969-10M
SERVICE AWARDS - RETIREMENT GIFTS

ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8
BIDDER Belt Buckle-Gold Belt Buckle-Two Tone | Belt Buckle-Bronze Cufflinks Jewelry Set Bracelet-Gold 5 Strand| Bracelet-Lady's ID Bracelet-Gold Filled
OC Tanner Sales Co. 111.07 252.95 60.22 16.71 78.45 23.82 40.43 27.64
Herff Jones Corp. Awards No Bid 26.32 21.89 65.53 30.68 No Bid 38.68 30.68
Terryberry Co. 44.22 52.68 39.53 77.18 18.56 27.51 39.11 28.82
Green Jewelry Co. 46.00 46.00 46.00 5.00 39.00 No Bid 32.00 29.20
ITEM 9 ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13 ITEM 14 ITEM 15 ITEM 16
BIDDER Bracelet-Gold Link | Bracelet-Man's Silver | Bracelet & Charm Bracelet-14K Card Case-Gold |Card Case-Black/Silver| Travel Jewelry Case Jewelry Box
OC Tanner Sales Co. 20.75 75.94 60.48 51.51 55.80 42.93 51.22 74.32
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 23.89 20.37 33.47 91.42 No Bid 31.47 No Bid 65.89
Terryberry Co. 64.19 18.46 46.02 108.59 15.80 15.80 27.94 52.76
Green Jewelry Co. 34.70 45.00 58.00 85.00 19.00 19.00 41.50 95.00
ITEM 17 ITEM 18 ITEM 19 ITEM 20 ITEM 21 ITEM 22 ITEM 23 ITEM 24
BIDDER Clock-Bulova Clock-Linden Wooden || Clock-Bulova Desk | Clock-Rosewood| Candelholder Crystal-Waterford Crystal Bowl w/Base Frame-Silver 5x7
OC Tanner Sales Co. 46.02 63.18 No Bid 12.53 58.56 44.10 28.88 49.12
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 60.26 100.68 43.89 50.47 112.26 134.21 No Bid 41.68
Terryberry Co. 42.37 43.33 43.38 32.27 76.14 47.21 75.06 19.74
Green Jewelry Co. 52.20 63.00 56.95 52.73 82.00 68.30 16.00 37.00
ITEM 25 ITEM 26 ITEM 27 ITEM 28 ITEM 29 ITEM 30 ITEM 31 ITEM 32
BIDDER Frame-Brass Key Ring Knife-Gold Plated Knife-Buck Knife-Swiss Army|Tool-Leatherman Blast| Money Clip-Gold PI. | Money Clip-Sunburst
OC Tanner Sales Co. 87.47 12.65 33.73 51.89 25.30 25.99 56.42 58.34
Herff Jones Corp. Awards No Bid 45.47 No Bid 63.74 23.21 61.74 29.05 No Bid
Terryberry Co. 23.02 21.18 32.41 46.96 18.28 48.24 23.67 52.90
Green Jewelry Co. 24.00 10.50 36.00 62.00 30.35 98.97 62.40 No Bid
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ITEM 33 ITEM 34 ITEM 35 ITEM 36 ITEM 37 ITEM 38 ITEM 39 ITEM 40
BIDDER Binoculars-Bushnell Briefcase-Leather Suitcase-Duffle Organizer-Silver [Necklace-GF Shad| Necklace-GF Braided | Necklace-SS Locket Sterling Silver Set
OC Tanner Sales Co. 27.27 26.26 58.05 30.52 32.51 52.81 38.33 80.09
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 129.42 133.42 201.42 21.05 36.16 No Bid 20.63 30.68
Terryberry Co. 41.39 49.18 45.68 20.26 35.23 34.88 29.23 37.90
Green Jewelry Co. 67.78 162.45 109.96 No Bid 46.50 No Bid 47.00 No Bid
ITEM 41 ITEM 42 ITEM 43 ITEM 44 ITEM 45 ITEM 46 ITEM 47 ITEM 48
BIDDER Necklace-18" Rope Necklace-Pearl Necklace-Figaro | Pen/Pencil-Black | Pen/Pencil-10K Chair/Cooler Telescope Globe
OC Tanner Sales Co. 34.80 34.74 41.96 47.94 32.38 43.00 72.07 79.93
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 36.53 30.63 39.79 63.16 88.42 148.26 137.42 90.89
Terryberry Co. 49.81 41.25 75.76 51.33 74.01 20.63 70.56 60.08
Green Jewelry Co. 53.75 No Bid No Bid 91.00 131.00 141.07 96.92 51.00
ITEM 49 ITEM 50 ITEM 51 ITEM 52 ITEM 53 ITEM 54 ITEM 55 ITEM 56
BIDDER Tool Kit Ring-Man's Silver |Ring-Woman's Silver| Watch-Lady's Watch-Man's [Watchband-Man's Gold| Watchband-Silver | Watchband-Woman's
OC Tanner Sales Co. 26.51 104.52 97.35 130.08 152.82 29.60 32.16 29.60
Herff Jones Corp. Awards No Bid 207.83 196.75 86.74 86.74 28.00 24.74 19.79
Terryberry Co. 23.92 115.75 115.75 68.70 68.70 28.38 21.08 20.57
Green Jewelry Co. 50.00 87.40 82.20 95.00 95.00 26.50 26.50 21.50
ITEM 57
BIDDER Watchband-Woman's
OC Tanner Sales Co. 32.16
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 18.56
Terryberry Co. 18.61
Green Jewelry Co. 21.50
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ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7 ITEM 8
BIDDER Telescope Clock-School House [Clock-Howard Miller| Clock-Fenton Sport Set Golf Travel Bag Digital Camera Luggage Set
OC Tanner Sales Co. 291.50 480.14 306.24 308.54 286.21 258.75 307.20 378.55
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 247.26 210.53 339.84 339.84 247.26 No Bid 468.42 487.79
Terryberry Co. 147.47 138.24 243.50 312.30 286.26 236.04 294.08 234.69
Green Jewelry Co. 352.95 210.00 379.68 433.44 386.70 259.00 399.00 316.00
ITEM 9 ITEM 10 ITEM 11 ITEM 12 ITEM 13 ITEM 14 ITEM 15 ITEM 16
BIDDER Crystal-Waterford Globe-Floor Globe & Atlas Pocket Watch Man's Ring Lady's Ring Man's Watch-Seiko [Man's Watch-Wittnauer
OC Tanner Sales Co. 360.20 466.16 309.37 324.58 647.56 661.81 278.29 582.22
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 127.21 438.89 185.53 210.53 639.79 488.30 204.00 438.89
Terryberry Co. 121.75 359.43 141.25 210.44 494.15 543.36 147.27 369.79
Green Jewelry Co. 170.00 234.00 224.00 303.43 472.00 348.00 225.00 583.59
ITEM 17 ITEM 18 ITEM 19
BIDDER Lady's Watch-Seiko [Lady's Watch-Wittnaue| Flatware
OC Tanner Sales Co. 272.74 582.22 547.81
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 204.00 438.89 342.84
Terryberry Co. 147.27 369.79 222.45
Green Jewelry Co. 225.10 583.59 398.00
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5 Year Award

10 Year Award

15 Year Award

20 Year Award

25 Year Award

BIDDER Purple Amethysts Diamond/Rubies Diamond/Sapphires | Diamond/Ruby [Diamond/Sapphire|
OC Tanner Sales Co. 40.35 110.39 110.39 181.54 181.54
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 67.07 146.57 146.57 226.07 226.07
Terryberry Co. 36.82 113.71 113.71 190.60 190.60
Green Jewelry Co. 60.70 111.70 111.70 162.70 162.70

30 Year Award
Diamonds-Three 5

35 Year Award
Diamonds-One 10

40 Year Award
Diamonds-Two 10

45 Year Award
Diamonds-Three

BIDDER point point & Two 5 point | point & One 5 point 10 point
OC Tanner Sales Co. 252.69 379.05 505.41 631.77
Herff Jones Corp. Awards 305.57 388.82 472.07 555.32
Terryberry Co. 267.49 362.16 456.83 551.50
Green Jewelry Co. 213.70 276.20 338.70 401.20




